



**Housing Authority**  
of the **City of Pittsburgh**

**TABULATION OF BIDS**

TITLE: IFB300-26-13 Disposition of Used Vehicles

BID OPENING DATE: November 4, 2013

BID OPENING TIME: 10:00am

BIDDERS NAME	TABULATION
* Gaudino Brothers LLC (all cars)	\$ 652.00 876.00
Mike Snipes	\$ No Bid 754.00 555.00
	\$ 678.00 No Bid No Bid
	No Bid 502.00 678.00
	727.00
Total	5422.00

WITNESSED BY: [Signature]  
(first witness)  
[Signature]  
(second witness)

DATE: 11/14/13  
DATE: 11/14/13



**TABULATION OF BIDS**

TITLE: IFB300-26-13 Disposition of Used Vehicles

BID OPENING DATE: November 4, 2013

BID OPENING TIME: 10:00am

BIDDERS NAME	TABULATION
<del>Gaudino Brothers LLC</del>	\$ No Bid 1,110.00 330.00
* Mike Snipes (all cars)	\$ 610.00 430.00 100.00
	\$ 105.00 105.00 105.00
	225.00 375.00 1010.00
Total	4505.00

WITNESSED BY:

Jim DeFazio  
(first witness)  
Corinne M. Desjardis  
(second witness)

DATE: 11/14/13

DATE: 11/14/13



**TABULATION OF BIDS**

TITLE: IFB300-26-13 Disposition of Used Vehicles

BID OPENING DATE: November 4, 2013

BID OPENING TIME: 10:00am

BIDDERS NAME	TABULATION
<del>Gaudino Brothers LLC</del>	\$ 900.00 700.00 200.00
<del>Mike Snipes</del>	\$ 900.00 900.00 800.00
* SD Transit, Inc. (all cars)	\$ 200.00 200.00 200.00
	400.00 800.00 800.00
Total	7,000.00

WITNESSED BY: Kim D. Bruce  
(first witness)  
Corinne M. Kisevski  
(second witness)

DATE: 11 / 14 / 13

DATE: 11 / 14 / 13